
Bid tabBID # 222-8761
Photographic Supplies

ITEM # Description UM Quantity Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1 Roll Paper 4x575(Fuji) roll 1 $36.95 36.95$           $41.90 41.90$           $70.47 70.47$             $51.50 51.50$           
Roll Paper 4x575 (Mitsubishi) roll 1 $35.75 35.75$           $39.50 39.50$           

2 Roll Paper 8x575 (Fuji) roll 1 $91.00 91.00$           $65.90 65.90$             $49.99 49.99$           
Roll Paper  8x575(Mitsubishi) roll 1 $82.45 82.45$           $79.50 79.50$           

3 Cut Paper 8x10 box 3 $97.05 291.15$         $89.72 269.16$           $82.50 247.50$         

4 Cut paper, 16” x 20”, B&W, box 2 $73.90 147.80$         $90.09 180.18$         $89.95 179.90$           $75.50 151.00$         

5 Cut paper, 11” x 14”, B&W, box 5 $36.20 181.00$         $46.96 234.80$         $44.20 221.00$           $37.99 189.95$         

6 Cut paper, 8” x 10”, color,
Kodak box 1 $17.55 17.55$           $19.95 19.95$             $19.99 19.99$           
Fuji box 1 $29.95 29.95$           $28.82 28.82$           $30.95 30.95$             no bid
Mitsubishi box 1 $24.90 24.90$           $25.16 25.16$           no bid no bid

7 Cut paper, 16” x 20”, color,
Kodak box 1 $54.70 54.70$           $45.11 45.11$           $64.95 64.95$             $54.68 54.68$           
Fuji box 1 $59.95 59.95$           $59.13 59.13$           $63.95 63.95$             
Mitsubishi box 1 $49.70 49.70$           $50.27 50.27$           

8 Roller Transport clean up strips 15 $94.70 1,420.50$      $67.43 1,011.45$      $114.95 1,724.25$        $109.99 1,649.85$      
PHOTO CHEMICALS

1
Paper developer, B&W, Kodak polymax 
T, 1 gallon size. 1 $35.25 35.25$           $37.25 37.25$           no bid $29.95 29.95$           

2 Indicator stop bath liquid, 8 gallon size ea 1 $5.40 5.40$            $6.70 6.70$             no bid no bid

3 Rapid fixer, liquid, 5 gallon size. ea 1 $28.35 $29.17 no bid $19.99

4 Photo Flo 200, 16 ounce size. btl 5 $7.15 $9.12 no bid $6.99

5 Developer replenisher, 6 x 10 liter per box.box 5 no bid no bid no bid

6 Developer starter, 2 x ½ gallon per box box 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid

7 Part A bleech, 12 x ½ gallon per box box 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid

8 Part B bleach, 12 x ½ gallon per box box 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid

9 Universal fixer, concentrated, 5 gallon size box 6 no bid no bid no bid no bid

10 Stabilizer, 6 x ½ gallon per box. box 3 no bid no bid no bid no bid
no bid

11 C-41 Bleach Replenisher      box 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid

12 Developer replenisher, 6 x 10 liter size. box 35 no bid no bid no bid no bid

13 Bleach fix replinisher, 6 x 10 liter size. box 35 no bid no bid no bid no bid

14 Developer starter, 2 x 1 gallon size. box 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid

NO BIDS: 
Notifications of Bid Availability
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