ITB NO. 522-8623

ESRI GIS/ARC SOFTWARE

OPENED: 12/27/01, 2:00 PM

Item/Description

VENDORS/PRICE

Canin Assoc. Applied Mapping,Inc. |[ESRI C&C Solutions,Inc. EarthData, Int'l I.S.N. IDAS, Inc. JE & A Assoc.,Inc. Systems Design,Inc Wilson Miller, Inc.
Orlando, FL Jax., FL (SBE) Redlands, CA Miami, FL (WBE) Miami, FL Tallahassee, FL (MBE)| Miami,FL (WBE) Gainesville, FL Omaha, NE Naples, FL
#1 ArcView 3.2/10pk 45,765 60,696 62,085.70 55,920 48,636 73,960 47,976 72,800 51,341.04 282,024
#2 ArcView 8.1 Upgr 5,250 5,390 6,000.00 5,400.00 5,600 5,790 5,350 5,500 5,000 6,000
#2 Alternate 10/pk 4,575|N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
#3 ArcIMS Std No Bid 6,733 6,750.00 6,750 5,985 6,825 6,295 5,700 5,550 6,000
#4 ArcIMS Std Addit |No Bid 4,305 4,500.00 4,500 3,985 4,550 4,149 3,800 4,100 4,000
#5 ArcView 3.x Spac |No Bid 4,478 4,491.00 4,490 4,462 4,700 4,198 4,000 3,650 4,492
#6 ArcView 3D Anal |No Bid 2,688 2,245.50 2,245 2,231 2,350 2,099 2,000 1,825 2,246
#7 ArcGIS Spac Anal |No Bid 2,239 2,250 2,250 1,985 2,350 2,099 2,000 1,830 2,000
#8ArcGIS 3D Concur |No Bid 2,150 2,250.00 2,250 1,985 2,350 2,099 2,000 1,830 2,000
#9 ArcPad w/Comp  |No Bid 2,865 2,985.00 1,497 2,925 3,495 2,835 2,850|No Bid 2,835
#10 Comp Dual-Slot |No Bid 735 660.00 1,425 1,800 2,145 1,695 1,800 |No Bid 1,800
#11 ArcPad No Bid 456 445.50 445 381 490 425 425 400 396
Total Cost-All Items  |N/A 92,735.00 94,754.08 87,172 79,975 109,005 79,220 102,875 75,526.04 313,793
Price Period: Mar-02|Not Stated 90 days 2-Jun|90 days 2/15/2002 4/30/2002|90 days Mar-02 3/31/2002
Avail to Others Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Not stated Yes Yes Yes Yes
Terms: N/30 3% award all items N/30 1% award all items  |N/30 N/30 1% award all items N/30 N/30 N/30
Freight: 200|PPD 91.38 Incl. PPD PPD PPD PPD PPD PPD
Comments: Inc upgrade to 3.3
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