
Proposal Tabulation
RFP 602-8267
Section 1.  Water Meter Rotation Program
Opening Date:  February 29, 2000

ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
Invensys Invensys Metro Meter Severn Trent- Severn Trent-
Measurement Measurement Service Avatar Avatar

(WBE) (w/o Connections) (w/Connections)
(# of Meters) Meter Installation Total Meter Installation Total Meter Installation Total Meter Installation Total Meter Installation Total

Meter Rotation Program
5/8" 29,500 27.40 42.50 2,062,050.00 22.50 42.50 1,917,500.00 25.00 23.00 1,416,000.00 28.37 20.00 1,426,915.00 32.25 20.00 1,541,375.00
3/4" 3,060 43.55 44.00 267,903.00 36.00 44.00 244,800.00 40.00 23.00 192,780.00 56.65 21.00 237,609.00 60.51 21.00 249,420.60
1" 16,200 64.89 45.25 1,784,268.00 60.50 45.25 1,713,150.00 57.00 23.00 1,296,000.00 81.90 23.00 1,699,380.00 90.15 23.00 1,833,030.00
1-1/2" 4900 176.00 148.00 1,587,600.00 148.00 148.00 1,450,400.00 160.00 60.00 1,078,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2" 2900 235.00 159.00 1,142,600.00 198.00 159.00 1,035,300.00 210.00 90.00 870,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL 6,844,421.00 6,361,150.00 4,852,780.00 3,363,904.00 3,623,825.60
(Incomplete) (Incomplete)

BRAND BID: SR PMX ABB C-700 Neptune T-10 Neptune T-10

Cost for Additional Meters
5/8" 27.40 22.50 25.00 28.37 32.25
3/4" 43.55 36.00 40.00 56.65 60.51
1" 64.89 60.50 57.00 81.90 90.15
1-1/2" 176.00 148.00 160.00 NO BID NO BID
2" 235.00 198.00 210.00 NO BID NO BID

Credit Allowance for Scrap Meters (Removed from the field)
5/8" 1.50 1.50 2.00 NONE NONE
3/4" 2.25 2.25 2.00 NONE NONE
1" 3.30 3.30 3.00 NONE NONE
1-1/2" 6.90 6.90 12.00 NONE NONE
2" 10.35 10.35 20.00 NONE NONE

Pricing does not include Pricing does not include Will return salvaged meters to City's designated warehouse for disposition by the City.
grounding or materials grounding or materials
to ground. to ground
See Cost Proposal See Cost Proposal
and Price Sheet and Price Sheet
Addendums Addendums
(ADD $881,842.00 to total) (ADD $881,842.00 to total)

Using Subcontractor: Yes No No
Includes Data Conversion: Yes Yes Not Addressed
Junk Meter Allowance: Yes Yes No
Work Schedule: Yes Yes Yes
    Cost Adjusted: No No No
Questionnaire: Yes Yes Yes
    Questions not answered: #4 None None
Additional Pricing Included: Yes Yes NO - Will only furnish meters and meter fittings.     

All other materials including meter boxes,
meter setting appurtenances and other materials
shall be furnished by the City or in the alternative
by vendor at an "extra cost" to the City.


