
Bid Tabulation
Bid 602-8328
Flexible Couplings
Opening Date:  6/15/00

A&B Pipe Crest/Good Home Hughes
& Supply Mfg. Depot Supply
(MBE)

Est. Annual Unit Unit Unit Unit
Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

Group A.  Couplings, Flexible
6" (1001-66) 250 10.44 2,610.00 12.54 3,135.00 13.88 3,470.00 9.70 2,425.00
8" (1001-88) 125 13.86 1,732.50 16.52 2,065.00 21.33 2,666.25 12.90 1,612.50
4"x4" (1002-44) 75 2.23 167.25 2.60 195.00 5.72 429.00 2.20 165.00
6"x4" (1002-64) 50 5.16 258.00 6.03 301.50 15.00 750.00 4.85 242.50
6"x6" (1002-66) 200 4.68 936.00 5.55 1,110.00 13.88 2,776.00 4.35 870.00
8"x6" (1002-86) 50 8.22 411.00 9.54 477.00 23.85 1,192.50 7.70 385.00
8"x8" (1002-88) 25 7.38 184.50 8.54 213.50 21.33 533.25 6.90 172.50
4"x4" (1056-44) 250 5.16 1,290.00 2.60 650.00 6.47 1,617.50 2.20 550.00
6"x6" (1056-66) 250 4.68 1,170.00 5.55 1,387.50 14.04 3,510.00 4.35 1,087.50
6"x6" (1056-66) 150 4.68 702.00 5.55 832.50 14.04 2,106.00 4.35 652.50
4" (NH-44) 50 2.09 104.50 2.34 117.00 2.93 146.50 4.85 242.50
6" (NH-66) 550 5.16 2,838.00 5.94 3,267.00 18.80 10,340.00 4.35 2,392.50
Brand Bid: FERNCO NOT STATED NOT STATED FERNCO
TOTAL 12,403.75 13,751.00 29,537.00 10,797.50

Group B.  Adapters, Bushing
6" (6.38 Diameter) 250 6.46 1,615.00 8.07 2,017.50 14.04 3,510.00 6.18 1,545.00
8" (8.50 Diameter) 100 9.55 955.00 11.97 1,197.00 21.33 2,133.00 8.85 885.00
8" (9.05 Diameter) 25 9.55 238.75 11.97 299.25 21.33 533.25 8.85 221.25
Brand Bid: FERNCO FERNCO NOT STATED FERNCO
TOTAL 2,808.75 3,513.75 6,176.25 2,651.25

Group C.  Wyes, Adapters, Plugs
Wye, 4" 25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 13.42 335.50 13.20 330.00
Wye, 6" 300 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 35.52 10,656.00 31.35 9,405.00
Adapter, 6" 300 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 36.66 10,998.00 23.00 6,900.00
Adapter, 4" 20 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 15.16 303.20 6.25 125.00
Plug 6" Raised Nut 150 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 12.44 1,866.00 5.30 795.00
Plug 6" Inverted Nut 150 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 5.30 795.00
Plug, 4" Raised Nut 25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 7.10 177.50 3.00 75.00
Plug, 4" Inverted Nut 25 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 3.00 75.00
Brand Bid: NO BID NO BID NOT STATED TYLER
TOTAL 24,336.20 18,500.00

Group D.  Couplings
Coupling, 10"x10" 100 0.00 0.00 12.15 1,215.00 12.29 1,229.00 10.20 1,020.00
Coupling, 8"x8" 100 0.00 0.00 16.52 1,652.00 8.19 819.00 12.65 1,265.00
Brand Bid: NO BID FERNCO NOT STATED FERNCO
TOTAL 2,867.00 2,048.00 2,285.00

GRAND TOTAL 15,212.50 20,131.75 62,097.45 34,233.75



Lawrence Lehman Lion Trayco US Filter
Plumbing Pipe Plumbing Inc. Dist.

Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

3.90 975.00 9.03 2,257.50 10.35 2,587.50 7.33 1,832.50 9.00 2,250.00
5.99 748.75 11.89 1,486.25 14.00 1,750.00 11.27 1,408.75 12.00 1,500.00
1.83 137.25 1.87 140.25 2.00 150.00 3.43 257.25 1.95 146.25
4.24 212.00 4.34 217.00 4.65 232.50 7.97 398.50 4.50 225.00
3.90 780.00 4.00 800.00 4.30 860.00 7.33 1,466.00 4.00 800.00
6.70 335.00 6.87 343.50 7.40 370.00 14.16 708.00 7.20 360.00
5.99 149.75 6.15 153.75 6.60 165.00 11.27 281.75 6.45 161.25
1.83 457.50 1.87 467.50 1.95 487.50 3.43 857.50 1.95 487.50
3.90 975.00 4.00 1,000.00 4.30 1,075.00 7.33 1,832.50 4.00 1,000.00
3.90 585.00 4.00 600.00 4.30 645.00 7.33 1,099.50 4.00 600.00
2.00 100.00 1.68 84.00 1.85 92.50 3.89 194.50 4.50 225.00
5.08 2,794.00 4.28 2,354.00 4.75 2,612.50 9.90 5,445.00 4.00 2,200.00

NOT STATED FERNCO MISSION NOT STATED FERNCO
8,249.25 9,903.75 11,027.50 15,781.75 9,955.00

5.79 1,447.50 5.81 1,452.50 4.35 1,087.50 8.88 2,220.00 5.75 1,437.50
8.58 858.00 8.62 862.00 11.30 1,130.00 13.17 1,317.00 8.50 850.00
8.58 214.50 8.62 215.50 11.30 282.50 13.17 329.25 8.50 212.50

NOT STATED FERNCO MISSION NOT STATED FERNCO
2,520.00 2,530.00 2,500.00 3,866.25 2,500.00

7.80 195.00 8.26 206.50 7.22 180.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
20.64 6,192.00 21.86 6,558.00 19.13 5,739.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
21.30 6,390.00 8.16 2,448.00 7.14 2,142.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

6.25 125.00 2.32 46.40 2.03 40.60 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6.84 1,026.00 5.04 756.00 4.41 661.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6.87 1,030.50 5.31 796.50 4.65 697.50 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3.27 81.75 2.87 71.75 2.51 62.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3.54 88.50 2.91 72.75 2.55 63.75 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

NOT STATED CHARLOTTE/LEE CHARLOTTE/LEE NO BID NO BID
15,128.75 10,955.90 9,587.60

8.71 871.00 8.75 875.00 9.40 940.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
11.84 1,184.00 11.89 1,189.00 6.60 660.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

NOT STATED FERNCO MISSION NO BID NO BID
2,055.00 2,064.00 1,600.00

27,953.00 25,453.65 24,715.10 19,648.00 12,455.00


