
Bid Tabulation
Bid 612-8350
Ductile Iron Pipe and C-900 PVC Pipe
Opening Date:  August 16, 2000

A&B Hughes Lion Rider SEMSCO US
Pipe Supply Plumbing Dist. Inc. Filter

Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Quantity Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

DI, 6"x18' 500 7.73 3,865.00 NO BID NO BID 10.60 5,300.00 6.13 3,065.00 8.40 4,200.00 7.89 3,945.00
 Length: 18' 18' 18.1' 20' 18'
 Manufacturer: McWane Griffin McWane American McWane/Clow
 Warranty: 1 Year N/A Not Stated Mfg. Factory
DI, 8"x18' 8000 10.37 82,960.00 NO BID NO BID 14.25 114,000.00 8.19 65,520.00 10.40 83,200.00 10.45 83,600.00
 Length: 18' 18' 18.1" 20' 18'
 Manufacturer: McWane Griffin McWane American McWane/Clow
 Warranty: 1 Year N/A Not Stated Mfg. Factory

Bids Firm for Acceptance For: 180 Days Not Applicable 30 Days 90 Days 15 Days 90 Days
Pricing Remains Firm For: 180 Days Not Applicable 30 Days 90 Days 15 Days 180 Days
TOTAL: 86,825.00 NO BID 119,300.00 68,585.00 87,400.00 87,545.00

PVC, 6"x20' 500 3.47 1,735.00 2.83 1,415.00 3.55 1,775.00 4.54 2,270.00 2.95 1,475.00 3.25 1,625.00
 Length: 20' 20' 20' 20' 20' 20'
 Manufacturer: J-M Diamond UPONOR-ETI Bristol J-M J-M
 Warranty: 1 Year 12 Months from Invoice 12 Months from Invoice Not Stated Mfg. Factory
PVC, 8"x20' 1000 5.77 5,770.00 4.90 4,900.00 6.10 6,100.00 7.29 7,290.00 5.02 5,020.00 4.95 4,950.00
 Length: 20' 20' 20' 20' 20' 20'
 Manufacturer: J-M Diamond UPONOR-ETI Bristol J-M J-M
 Warranty:  1 Year 12 Months from Invoice 12 Months from Invoice Not Stated Mfg. Factory

Bids Firm for Acceptance For: 90 Days 30 Days 30 Days Order by 8/3 15 Days 15-30 Days
Pricing Remains Firm For: 90 Days 30 Days 30 Days Ship by 9/3 15 Days 180 Days
TOTAL: 7,505.00 6,315.00 7,875.00 9,560.00 6,495.00 6,575.00

GRAND TOTAL: 94,330.00 6,315.00 127,175.00 78,145.00 93,895.00 94,120.00


