
532-8881 RADIO CELLULAR PARTS

Quan Short Description Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost
100 800MHz ¼ wave for MOT LARSON/SPWH21832 $10.56 $1,056.00 MOT/8505241U06 $18.30 $1,830.00 MOT/8505241U06 $19.51 $1,951.00
100 800MHz ½ wave for MOT CENT/EXE-806-SF $13.50 $1,350.00 MOT/8505241U03 $25.30 $2,530.00 MOT/8505241U03 $30.31 $3,031.00

5 800MHz dipole for MOT CENT/EXE-806-SF $13.50 $67.50 MOT/NAF4000B $24.70 $123.50 MOT/NAF4000B $29.75 $148.75
20 800 MHz ½ wave for EFJ CENT/EXE-806-SF $13.50 $270.00 EFJ/585-5000-053 $39.00 $780.00
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave kit ANTX/QWB470- $16.60 $99.60 MOT/HAE4004A $12.30 $73.80 MOT/HAE4004A $16.15 $96.90
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave rod ANTX/QWB470 $6.63 $39.78 MOT/0180352A12 $4.00 $24.00 MOT/0180352A12 $4.85 $29.10
25 460-470MHz ¼ wave kit ANTX/QW450-MB8UMI $13.68 $342.00 MOT/TAE6052A $12.30 $307.50 MOT/TAE6052A $16.15 $403.75
20 460-470MHz ¼ wave rod QW450 $3.71 $74.20 MOT/0180352A11 $4.00 $80.00 MOT/0180352A11 $4.85 $97.00
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave kit ASP/ASPR1910 $10.07 $503.50 MOT/HAF4002A $10.10 $505.00 MOT/HAF4002A $11.90 $595.00
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave rod ASP/ASPR1950 $4.91 $245.50 MOT/0180351A90 $3.30 $165.00 MOT/0180351A90 $3.83 $191.50
6 806-866MHz 3dB kit NO BID MOT/RRA4914 $20.60 $123.60 MOT/RRA4914 $32.30 $193.80
6 806-866MHz 3dB rod NO BID MOT/0180372A90 $7.50 $45.00 MOT/0180372A90 $9.99 $59.94
6 806-866MHz Low Profile ASTRON/NP8500 $43.18 $259.08 NP/NP8500 $48.31 $289.86 $0.00
5 806-866 MHz 6dB Yagi COMT/Y2283B $25.99 $129.95 COMT/Y2283B $29.92 $149.60 $0.00

100 Motorola NTN5414B UNKN/H5414 $31.44 $3,144.00 ?/AM5413 $21.00 $2,100.00 MOT/NTN5414BR $18.90 $1,890.00
500 Motorola NTN7144A MULT/M7144 $32.67 $16,335.00 ?/AM7144 $20.00 $10,000.00 MOT/NTN7144CR $14.73 $7,365.00
50 Motorola NTN4595CR MULT/M4595H $43.88 $2,194.00 ?/AM4595 $24.00 $1,200.00 MOT/NTN4595DR $24.70 $1,235.00
50 Motorola HNN9628A MULT/M9628 $31.20 $1,560.00 KENDOO/M-42 $16.00 $800.00 MOT/HNN9628B $11.50 $575.00
10 Motorola RNN4006AR NO BID [58.50] MOT/RNN4006AR $116.00 $1,160.00 MOT/RNN4006AR $65.00 $650.00
50 Motorola NTN8923A MULT/M8923 $50.70 $2,535.00 MOT/NTN8923A $88.00 $4,400.00 MOT/NTN8923AR $52.00 $2,600.00
50 Motorola NTN8294A MULT/M8294 $44.85 $2,242.50 BZ/BZ8294 $47.00 $2,350.00 MOT/NTN8294BR $49.00 $2,450.00
50 Motorola NTN8297A MULT/M8297 $56.42 $2,821.00 MOT/NTN8297A $96.00 $4,800.00 MOT/NTN8297AR $52.00 $2,600.00
20 EFJ 587-8150-135 NO BID [55.07] BZ/BZR135MH $52.00 $1,040.00
6 UHF male, for RG58 RF/RFU505ST $1.91 $11.46 RF/RFU-505-ST $1.50 $9.00
6 UHF male, for RG8 RF/RFU507ST $1.85 $11.10 RF/RFU-500 $0.84 $5.04 MOT/2882021G01 $3.49 $20.94
25 Mini-UHF male, RG58 RF/RFU-600 $1.77 $44.25 TCC/12-OLF-DCN $0.55 $13.75 MOT/2880376E62 $0.54 54.29/100
10 Mini-UHF female, RG58 RF/RFU601-1 $1.06 $10.60 RF/RFU-601-1 $0.88 $8.80
5 Type N male, RG58 RF/RFN1005-3C $1.89 $9.45 RF/RFN1275-3C $2.20 $11.00
4 Type N male, RG8 RF/RFN1002-1S $5.03 $20.12 RF/RFN1276-3E $2.86 $11.44
6 H.D. Cigarette plug TES/CIG.PLUG $5.60 $33.60 UNABLE TO READ $6.50 $39.00
25 SPDT Rocker Switch UNKN/0-332-209-138 $3.49 $87.25 RADSH/275-690 $3.50 $87.50
50 Horn Type Speaker SPC/SPC8 $9.50 $475.00 SPC/SPC8 $9.33 $466.50

150 18 ga Zip cord SUPWIRE/18SW $17.40 $2,610.00 SUPWIRE/18JPT-250 $0.18 $27.00
10 Single Charger w/adaptor ACT/I10 $98.12 $981.20 ADVT/AT2051IFD $72.00 $720.00
5 Gang Charger w/adaptors ACT/I60 $542.50 $2,712.50 AVT/AT402051IFD $340.00 $1,700.00
10 MTS2000 adaptor ACT/IMOT10-NCD $27.00 $270.00 ADVT/AT2051PL $16.32 $163.20
10 XTS3000/5000 adaptor ACT/IMOT17-NMH $27.00 $270.00 ADVT/AT2051PL $16.32 $163.20
10 Vehicular Holder ADVT/AT9960 $25.09 $250.90 ADVT/AT9960 $26.70 $267.00

100 RG58A/U Coax BLDN/8219 $0.19 $19.00 BLDN/8219 $0.21 $21.00
100 RG8A/U Coax BLDN/8214 $0.58 $58.00 BLDN/8214 $0.64 $64.00
100 ¼” Superflex AND/FSJ1-50A $0.86 $86.00 AND/FJJ1-50A $0.88 $88.00
100 3/8” Transmission Line AND/LDF2-50 $0.98 $98.00 AND/LDF2-50 $0.99 $99.00
100 ½” Transmission Line AND/LDF4-50A $1.32 $132.00 AND/LDF4-50A $1.35 $135.00
100 7/8” Transmission Line AND/LDF5-50A $3.01 $301.00 AND/LDF5-50A $3.07 $307.00
10 Type N male for superflex AND/F1PNMV2-H $14.19 $141.90 AND/F1PNMV2-H $13.05 $130.50
10 BNC male for superflex AND/F1PBM $7.10 $71.00 AND/F1PSM $6.52 $65.20
10 Mini-UHF for superflex AND/F1MU $12.71 $127.10 AND/F1MU $11.70 $117.00
10 Type N male for 3/8” AND/L2PNM-HC $17.77 $177.70 AND/L2PNM-H $16.30 $163.00
2 Type N male for ½” AND/L4PNM-RC $18.37 $36.74 AND/L4PNM-H $20.85 $41.70
2 Type N female for ½” AND/L4PNF-RC $18.37 $36.74 AND/L4PNF-RC $17.00 $34.00
2 Type N male for 7/8” AND/L5PNM-RPC $29.76 $59.52 AND/L5PNM-RPC $27.80 $55.60
2 Type N female for 7/8” AND/L5PNF-RPC $29.76 $59.52 AND/L5PNF-RPC $27.80 $55.60
1 IS-B50LN-C1 POLY $49.37 $49.37 POLY $45.20 $45.20
1 IS-CT50HN-B POLY $85.09 $85.09 POLY $80.25 $80.25
1 IS-CT50HN-B-MA POLY $85.09 $85.09 POLY $80.25 $80.25
1 IS-UT50HN-B POLY $99.53 $99.53 POLY $94.00 $94.00
2 25P10GB Ground Buss POLY $22.01 $44.02 POLY $20.60 $41.20
50 IS-MPT-17 t/p protector POLY $8.33 $416.50 POLY $7.80 $390.00

Compliant amount: $3,154.10 $3,289.60 $19,385.94

Cellular: Can Provide ALL YES YES NO
Average Discount Level 46.28%

The items that are grayed out were not properly bid and are being removed from this bid for later resolution.  
Vendors chosen for awards are TESSCO - in the estimated amount of $7,000.00 for cellular and indicated items; 
Holzberg - in the estimated amount of $6,000.00 for cellular and indicated items; Motorola - in the estimated 
amount of $20,000.00 for the indicated items, Battery Zone - in the estimated amount of $8,000.00 for the indicated
items.  Bearcom was requested to provide clarification on specific items on multiple occasions.  The information 
that was finally provided did not correlate with the bid item list.  Signal Communications was low bidder on only two 
items with an estimated yearly difference of $20.50, insufficient to justify the cost of including them.  Their cellular 
pricing does not allow comparison to the other vendors due to the method they choose and a lack of a parts/price 
list.  Other bidders were not competitive with their peers.  Pricing for cellular items will be obtained from TESSCO 
and Holzberg on an "as-needed" basis to insure we receive the best cost value.  

MUST BE CALCULATED FROM 
EXTENSIVE PARTS LISTING.

MOTOROLATESSCO HOLZBERG COMMUNICATIONS



532-8881 RADIO CELLULAR PARTS

Quan Short Description
100 800MHz ¼ wave for MOT
100 800MHz ½ wave for MOT

5 800MHz dipole for MOT
20 800 MHz ½ wave for EFJ
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave kit
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave rod
25 460-470MHz ¼ wave kit
20 460-470MHz ¼ wave rod
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave kit
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave rod
6 806-866MHz 3dB kit
6 806-866MHz 3dB rod
6 806-866MHz Low Profile
5 806-866 MHz 6dB Yagi

100 Motorola NTN5414B
500 Motorola NTN7144A
50 Motorola NTN4595CR
50 Motorola HNN9628A
10 Motorola RNN4006AR
50 Motorola NTN8923A
50 Motorola NTN8294A
50 Motorola NTN8297A
20 EFJ 587-8150-135
6 UHF male, for RG58
6 UHF male, for RG8
25 Mini-UHF male, RG58
10 Mini-UHF female, RG58
5 Type N male, RG58
4 Type N male, RG8
6 H.D. Cigarette plug
25 SPDT Rocker Switch
50 Horn Type Speaker

150 18 ga Zip cord
10 Single Charger w/adaptor
5 Gang Charger w/adaptors
10 MTS2000 adaptor
10 XTS3000/5000 adaptor
10 Vehicular Holder

100 RG58A/U Coax
100 RG8A/U Coax
100 ¼” Superflex
100 3/8” Transmission Line
100 ½” Transmission Line
100 7/8” Transmission Line
10 Type N male for superflex
10 BNC male for superflex
10 Mini-UHF for superflex
10 Type N male for 3/8”
2 Type N male for ½”
2 Type N female for ½”
2 Type N male for 7/8”
2 Type N female for 7/8”
1 IS-B50LN-C1
1 IS-CT50HN-B
1 IS-CT50HN-B-MA
1 IS-UT50HN-B
2 25P10GB Ground Buss 
50 IS-MPT-17 t/p protector

Compliant amount:

Cellular: Can Provide ALL
Average Discount Level

Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
BZ/BZ5414 $17.85 $1,785.00
BZ/BZ7144 $15.50 $7,750.00
BZ/BZ4595 $18.60 $930.00
BZ/BZ9628 $15.00 $750.00
BZ/BZ4006 $30.00 $300.00
BZ/BZ8299MH $27.00 $1,350.00
BZ/BZ8294 $23.50 $1,175.00
BZ/BZ8297 $50.00 $2,500.00
BZ/BZ135NiMH $38.00 $760.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00
NO BID $0.00

$7,870.00

NO

BATTERY ZONE



532-8881 RADIO CELLULAR PARTS

Quan Short Description
100 800MHz ¼ wave for MOT
100 800MHz ½ wave for MOT

5 800MHz dipole for MOT
20 800 MHz ½ wave for EFJ
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave kit
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave rod
25 460-470MHz ¼ wave kit
20 460-470MHz ¼ wave rod
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave kit
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave rod
6 806-866MHz 3dB kit
6 806-866MHz 3dB rod
6 806-866MHz Low Profile
5 806-866 MHz 6dB Yagi

100 Motorola NTN5414B
500 Motorola NTN7144A
50 Motorola NTN4595CR
50 Motorola HNN9628A
10 Motorola RNN4006AR
50 Motorola NTN8923A
50 Motorola NTN8294A
50 Motorola NTN8297A
20 EFJ 587-8150-135
6 UHF male, for RG58
6 UHF male, for RG8
25 Mini-UHF male, RG58
10 Mini-UHF female, RG58
5 Type N male, RG58
4 Type N male, RG8
6 H.D. Cigarette plug
25 SPDT Rocker Switch
50 Horn Type Speaker

150 18 ga Zip cord
10 Single Charger w/adaptor
5 Gang Charger w/adaptors
10 MTS2000 adaptor
10 XTS3000/5000 adaptor
10 Vehicular Holder

100 RG58A/U Coax
100 RG8A/U Coax
100 ¼” Superflex
100 3/8” Transmission Line
100 ½” Transmission Line
100 7/8” Transmission Line
10 Type N male for superflex
10 BNC male for superflex
10 Mini-UHF for superflex
10 Type N male for 3/8”
2 Type N male for ½”
2 Type N female for ½”
2 Type N male for 7/8”
2 Type N female for 7/8”
1 IS-B50LN-C1
1 IS-CT50HN-B
1 IS-CT50HN-B-MA
1 IS-UT50HN-B
2 25P10GB Ground Buss 
50 IS-MPT-17 t/p protector

Compliant amount:

Cellular: Can Provide ALL
Average Discount Level

Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost
MOT/8505241U06 $20.00 $2,000.00 MOT/UNKN $24.70 $2,470.00 MOT/8505241U06 $23.00 $2,300.00
MOT/8505241U03 $27.50 $2,750.00 MOT/UNKN $37.10 $3,710.00 MOT/8505241U03 $32.00 $3,200.00
MOT/NAF4000B $27.25 $136.25 MOT/UNKN $34.50 $172.50 MOT/NAF400B $33.00 $165.00
EFJ/585-5000-053 $40.00 $800.00 NO BID $0.00 CENT/EXE806SPJ $33.00 $660.00
MOT/HAE4004A $14.50 $87.00 MOT/UNKN $19.10 $114.60 MOT/HAE4004A $23.00 $138.00
MOT/0180352A12 $5.00 $30.00 MOT/UNKN $5.50 $33.00 MOT/0180352A12 $8.00 $48.00
MOT/TAE6052A $12.50 $312.50 MOT/UNKN $19.00 $475.00 MOT/TAE6052A $19.00 $475.00
MOT/0180352A11 $5.00 $100.00 MOT/UNKN $5.70 $114.00 MOT/0180352A11 $8.00 $160.00
MOT/HAF4002A $12.25 $612.50 MOT/UNKN $13.50 $675.00 MOT/HAF4002A $15.00 $750.00
MOT/0180351A90 $4.25 $212.50 MOT/UNKN $4.45 $222.50 MOT/0180251A90 $10.00 $500.00
MOT/RRA4914 $23.00 $138.00 NO BID $0.00 MOT/RRA9143 $30.00 $180.00
MOT/0180372A90 $9.50 $57.00 NO BID $0.00 MOT/0180372A90 $14.00 $84.00
NP/NP8500 $64.32 $385.92 NO BID $0.00 NP/NP8500 $60.00 $360.00
ANTX/Y8066 $66.30 $331.50 NO BID $0.00 COMT/Y2283B $62.00 $310.00
MOT/NTN5414B $50.00 $5,000.00 MULT/UNKN $31.92 $3,192.00 MOT/NTN5414BR $52.00 $5,200.00
MOT/NTN7144A $75.00 $37,500.00 MULT/UNKN $27.35 $13,675.00 MOT/NTN7144CR $84.00 $42,000.00
MOT/NTN4595CR $68.00 $3,400.00 MULT/UNKN $37.00 $1,850.00 MOT/NTN4595DR $75.00 $3,750.00
MOT/HNN9628A $65.00 $3,250.00 MULT/UNKN $28.20 $1,410.00 MOT/HNN9628B $72.00 $3,600.00
MOT/RNN4006AR $105.00 $1,050.00 MULT/UNKN $125.00 $1,250.00 MOT/RNN4006B $125.00 $1,250.00
MOT/NTN8923A $87.75 $4,387.50 MULT/UNKN $47.00 $2,350.00 MOT/NTN8923AR $95.00 $4,750.00
MOT/NTN8924A $100.00 $5,000.00 MULT/UNKN $40.00 $2,000.00 MOT/NTN8297AR $75.00 $3,750.00
MOT/NTN8927A $130.00 $6,500.00 MULT/UNKN $122.00 $6,100.00 MOT/NTN8297AR $105.00 $5,250.00
EFJ/587-8150-135 $70.00 $1,400.00 NO BID $0.00 BZ/BZR135MH $61.00 $1,220.00
RF/RFU505-ST $1.97 $11.82 NO BID $0.00 MOT/2880385B95 $15.00 $15.00
RF/RFN1002-1S $4.91 $29.46 NO BID $0.00 MOT/2882021G01 $4.00 $24.00
RF/RFU-600-1 $1.00 $25.00 NO BID $0.00 MOT/2880376E62 $64.00 $64.00
RF/RFU-601-1 $1.04 $10.40 NO BID $0.00 MOT/0984784N01 $9.00 $90.00
RF/RFN1005-3C $1.97 $9.85 NO BID $0.00 MOT/2800852527 $22.00 $110.00
RF/RFN1006PL $4.55 $18.20 NO BID $0.00 MOT/2800852527 $22.00 $88.00
TES/CIG.PLUG $5.42 $32.52 NO BID $0.00 AMS/PLUG $10.00 $60.00
GCWAL/35-132 $3.70 $92.50 NO BID $0.00 UNKN/SPC8433-0292 $6.00 $150.00
SPC/SPC8 $9.50 $475.00 NO BID $0.00 SPC/36C5695 $19.00 $950.00
SUPWIR/18SPT-250 $16.99 $2,548.50 NO BID $0.00 MCM/24-1875 $7.00 $1,050.00
ADVT/I10 $147.00 $1,470.00 NO BID $0.00 ADVT/AT2-2051IFD $95.00 $950.00
ADVT/I65 $841.20 $4,206.00 NO BID $0.00 ADVT/AT4-2051-IFD $375.00 $1,875.00
ACT/A-MOT10 $27.00 $270.00 NO BID $0.00 ADVT/AT2051-PL $25.00 $250.00
ACT/I-MOT17-NCD $27.00 $270.00 NO BID $0.00 ADVT/AT2059-PL $25.00 $250.00
NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 ADVT/AT9960 $35.00 $350.00
BLDN/8219 $0.25 $25.00 NO BID $0.00 BLDN/8219 $0.45 $45.00
BLDN/8214 $1.00 $100.00 NO BID $0.00 BLDN/8214 $1.00 $100.00
CW/SCF14-50JFN $1.50 $150.00 NO BID $0.00 AND/FSJ1-50A $1.55 $155.00
CW/LCF38-50J $1.50 $150.00 NO BID $0.00 AND/LDF2-50 $1.75 $175.00
CW/F1C12-50J $2.00 $200.00 NO BID $0.00 AND/LDF4-50A $2.30 $230.00
CW/LCF78-50J $5.00 $500.00 NO BID $0.00 AND/LDF5-50A $6.10 $610.00
CW/734769 $18.29 $182.90 NO BID $0.00 AND/F1PNM-H $27.00 $270.00
CW/734778 $10.13 $101.30 NO BID $0.00 AND/F1PBM $14.00 $140.00
CW/734924 $8.63 $86.30 NO BID $0.00 AND/F1MV $23.00 $230.00
CW/734761 $20.04 $200.40 NO BID $0.00 AND/L2PNM-H $33.00 $330.00
CW/738802 $22.61 $45.22 NO BID $0.00 AND/L2PNM-H $33.00 $66.00
CW/738801 $22.61 $45.22 NO BID $0.00 AND/L4PNF $45.00 $90.00
CW/738841 $52.05 $104.10 NO BID $0.00 AND/L5PNM-RPC $58.00 $116.00
CW/738842 $52.05 $104.10 NO BID $0.00 AND/L5PNF-RPC $58.00 $116.00
POLY $55.34 $55.34 NO BID $0.00 POLY $70.00 $70.00
POLY $90.00 $90.00 NO BID $0.00 POLY $120.00 $120.00
POLY $91.77 $91.77 NO BID $0.00 POLY $120.00 $120.00
POLY $106.49 $106.49 NO BID $0.00 POLY $140.00 $140.00
POLY $27.44 $54.88 NO BID $0.00 POLY $36.00 $72.00
POLY $10.49 $524.50 NO BID $0.00 POLY $12.00 $600.00

ZERO ZERO ZERO

NO NO YES
5%

AMS BATTERIES AND CELLULARBEARCOM ELECTRONIC DEPOT



532-8881 RADIO CELLULAR PARTS

Quan Short Description
100 800MHz ¼ wave for MOT
100 800MHz ½ wave for MOT

5 800MHz dipole for MOT
20 800 MHz ½ wave for EFJ
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave kit
6 470-480MHz ¼ wave rod
25 460-470MHz ¼ wave kit
20 460-470MHz ¼ wave rod
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave kit
50 806-866MHz ¼ wave rod
6 806-866MHz 3dB kit
6 806-866MHz 3dB rod
6 806-866MHz Low Profile
5 806-866 MHz 6dB Yagi

100 Motorola NTN5414B
500 Motorola NTN7144A
50 Motorola NTN4595CR
50 Motorola HNN9628A
10 Motorola RNN4006AR
50 Motorola NTN8923A
50 Motorola NTN8294A
50 Motorola NTN8297A
20 EFJ 587-8150-135
6 UHF male, for RG58
6 UHF male, for RG8
25 Mini-UHF male, RG58
10 Mini-UHF female, RG58
5 Type N male, RG58
4 Type N male, RG8
6 H.D. Cigarette plug
25 SPDT Rocker Switch
50 Horn Type Speaker

150 18 ga Zip cord
10 Single Charger w/adaptor
5 Gang Charger w/adaptors
10 MTS2000 adaptor
10 XTS3000/5000 adaptor
10 Vehicular Holder

100 RG58A/U Coax
100 RG8A/U Coax
100 ¼” Superflex
100 3/8” Transmission Line
100 ½” Transmission Line
100 7/8” Transmission Line
10 Type N male for superflex
10 BNC male for superflex
10 Mini-UHF for superflex
10 Type N male for 3/8”
2 Type N male for ½”
2 Type N female for ½”
2 Type N male for 7/8”
2 Type N female for 7/8”
1 IS-B50LN-C1
1 IS-CT50HN-B
1 IS-CT50HN-B-MA
1 IS-UT50HN-B
2 25P10GB Ground Buss 
50 IS-MPT-17 t/p protector

Compliant amount:

Cellular: Can Provide ALL
Average Discount Level

Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost Manufacturer/Model

Firm, Fixed 
Unit 

Cost/Each

Estimated 
Annual 

Total Cost
MOT/8505241U06 $23.55 $2,355.00 STATED PER ITB $17.16 $1,716.00
MOT/8505241U03 $34.81 $3,481.00 STATED PER ITB $24.85 $2,485.00
MOT/NAF4000B $32.83 $164.15 STATED PER ITB $25.51 $127.55
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $35.64 $712.80
MOT/HAE4004A $16.25 $97.50 STATED PER ITB $12.63 $75.78
MOT/0180352A12 $5.20 $31.20 STATED PER ITB $4.04 $24.24
MOT/TAE6052A $16.25 $406.25 STATED PER ITB $11.60 $290.00
MOT/0180352A11 $5.20 $104.00 STATED PER ITB $3.92 $78.40
MOT/HAF4002A $13.33 $666.50 STATED PER ITB $10.57 $528.50
MOT/0180351A90 $4.23 $211.50 STATED PER ITB $3.36 $168.00
MOT/RRA4914B $27.30 $163.80 STATED PER ITB $21.65 $129.90
MOT/0180372A90 $9.75 $58.50 STATED PER ITB $7.73 $46.38
MOT/RAF4219A $26.65 $159.90 STATED PER ITB $48.56 $291.36
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $31.38 $156.90
MOT/NTN5414BR $58.50 $5,850.00 STATED PER ITB $37.29 $3,729.00
MOT/NTN7144CR $85.09 $42,545.00 STATED PER ITB $39.48 $19,740.00
MOT/NTN4595DR $86.00 $4,300.00 STATED PER ITB $43.87 $2,193.50
MOT/HNN9628B $78.00 $3,900.00 STATED PER ITB $32.90 $1,645.00
MOT/RNN4006A $112.50 $1,125.00 STATED PER ITB $102.06 $1,020.60
MOT/NTN8923A $107.58 $5,379.00 STATED PER ITB $76.79 $3,839.50
MOT/NTN8924A $83.60 $4,180.00 STATED PER ITB $58.00 $2,900.00
MOT/NTN8924A $117.00 $5,850.00 STATED PER ITB $83.51 $4,175.50
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $67.72 $1,354.40
RF/RFU-505 $1.76 $10.56 TIMES/RFU505 $1.64 $9.84
RF/RFU507 $1.86 $11.16 TIMES/RFU500 $1.22 $7.32
RF/RFU-600-6 $2.02 $50.50 TIMES/RMUHF $1.11 $27.75
RF/RFU-6001-1 $1.40 $14.00 TIMES/RFU6011 $1.29 $12.90
RF/RFN1005-3C $4.48 $22.40 TIMES/RFN10053C $3.97 $19.85
RF/RFN1006-3E $4.91 $19.64 TIMES/10001S $5.27 $21.08
NO BID $0.00 JST/2A5071 $6.82 $40.92
NO BID $0.00 AUGAT/EG1891 $3.68 $92.00
NO BID $0.00 SPC/SPC-8 $9.80 $490.00
NO BID $0.00 SUPWIRE/UNKN $0.12 $18.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $91.58 $915.80
MOT/UNKN $624.00 $3,120.00 STATED PER ITB $488.42 $2,442.10
MOT/NTN1172A $82.81 $828.10 STATED PER ITB $24.21 $242.10
MOT/WPPN4086AR $110.50 $1,105.00 STATED PER ITB $24.21 $242.10
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $92.58 $925.80
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $0.16 $16.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $0.72 $72.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $1.18 $118.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $0.80 $80.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $1.50 $150.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $3.47 $347.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $25.63 $256.30
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $17.60 $176.00
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $13.16 $131.60
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $18.17 $181.70
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $23.13 $46.26
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $22.90 $45.80
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $46.48 $92.96
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $46.48 $92.96
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $55.11 $55.11
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $95.16 $95.16
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $95.77 $95.77
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $111.31 $111.31
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $23.20 $46.40
NO BID $0.00 STATED PER ITB $9.37 $468.50

ZERO ZERO

YES YES
25% DC + 5%

Dealer Cost Plus 5%.  With 
no pricing provided can not 
make comparison.

AMERICAN WIRELESS SIGNAL COMMUNICATIONS


