Description

Coat

Pants
Suspenders
Helmet/Passport
Gloves

Boots

NO BIDS: 4
Tri-Anim

Fire Appartus
Safety Products
Bruce Bartz

8968 Prox Gear.xls

ITB 942-8968

Proximity Gear

Fire-Rescue
Axis Bennett Fire Eisher Fire Municipal Equip Pro-AM Safety
Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

8 594.00 $ 4,752.00 578.00 $ 4,624.00 $698.99 $ 5591.92| $530.00] $ 4,240.00 713.80 $ 5,710.40
8  453.00 3,624.00 436.00 3,488.00 476.34 3,810.72  450.00 3,600.00 563.95 4511.6
8 13.00 104.00 15.00 120.00 26.38 211.04 24.00 192.00 28.17 225.36
8  394.00 3,152.00 563.00 4,504.00 no bid no bid 430.00 3,440.00 no bid no bid
8 47.50 380.00 72.00 576.00 86.74 693.92 102.00 816.00 52.58 420.64
8 118.00 944.00 124.00 992.00 104.88 839.04 128.00 1,024.00 no bid no bid

$ 12,956.00 $ 14,304.00 $ 11,146.64 $ 13,312.00 $ 10,868.00
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