City of Fort Lauderdale

Bid #562-9341 - Medical Supply Items

Creation Date Dec 6, 2005
Start Date

Dec 8, 2005 4:15:20 PM EST

End Date
Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

Dec 22, 2005 2:00:00 PM EST

Bid 562-9341

562-9341-1-01 Sterile Water, 500 ml

Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Moore Medical LLC | First Offer - $0.99 | 350 / each $346.50 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 69383
Vendor Notes:
Bottles B Braun #R5001-01
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | | First Offer - $1.02 | 350 / each | $357.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 118-2F7113
Vendor Notes:
Sold 18 per case $18.36
Henry Schein Inc | | First Offer - $1.08 | 350 / each | $378.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 5075001
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | | First Offer - $1.10 | 350 / each | $385.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0852
Vendor Notes:
Bound Tree Medical | | First Offer - $1.34 | 350 / each | $469.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 607114
Vendor Notes:
Boca Medical Supply | |First Offer - $1.841 | 350 / each | $644.35 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: MCG850101
Vendor Notes:
Only available in cases of 24/each. Will need to
increase order to gqty. 360
Gate Medicals, lic || First Offer - $2.15 | 350/ each | $752.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
B braun sterile H20 bags.
patriot medical supplies | | First Offer - $2.17 | 350 / each | $759.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8137
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $2.30 350 / each $805.00 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: B13903
Vendor Notes:
ABBOTT/HOSPIRA
QUADMED INC || First Offer - $3.50 | 350 / each | $1,225.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: ABBOTT/HOSPIRA
Vendor Notes:
500ML BOTTLE
562-9341-1-02 5cc Syringe
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical First Offer - $0.0549 100 / each $5.49 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 620200
Vendor Notes:
THIS ITEM IS ONLY SOLD PER BOX
100/BOX
$5.49/BOX
Henry Schein Inc | | First Offer - $0.08 100 / each $8.00 | | Y
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Agency Notes:

City of Fort Lauderdale

Bid 562-9341

Supplier Product Code: 1007847
Vendor Notes:
Sold 100/bx for $7.47

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

|| First Offer - $0.092

100 / each | $9.20 | |

<

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 47-8881516937BX
Vendor Notes:
Kendall 6CC syringe, sold 50 per box $4.60

Boca Medical Supply

| |First offer - $0.0952

100/ each | $9.52 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: EXC26230
Vendor Notes:
Available in boxes containing 100/each.

Moore Medical LLC

| |First offer - $0.1182

100/ each | $11.82 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 36826
Vendor Notes:
Terumo #SSO05L Sold by the box of 100 only

Alliance Medical

|| First Offer - $0.12

100/ each | $12.00 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 0991
Vendor Notes:
Minimum order quantity is pk/10ea

patriot medical supplies

|| First Offer - $0.36

100/ each | $36.00 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: JG5CC-LL
Vendor Notes:

Gate Medicals, llc

|| First Offer - $0.42

100/ each | $42.00 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:

QUADMED INC

|| First Offer - $1.25

100/ each | $125.00 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TERUMO
Vendor Notes:
0o5L

HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS

MEDICAL SUPPLI

First Offer - $19.80

100 / each $1,980.00 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 309603
Vendor Notes:
BD

562-9341-1-03 23 Gauge Needles

Vendor

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

| First Offer - $0.04

150 / each $6.00 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 47-8881250255BX
Vendor Notes:
Sold 100 per box $4.00

Henry Schein Inc

|| First Offer - $0.04

150 / each | $6.00 | | v

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 1005544
Vendor Notes:
Sold $3.56 for a box of 100.

Boca Medical Supply

| |First offer - $0.0511

150 / each | $7.665 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: EXC26408
Vendor Notes:

Available in boxes of 100/each. Will need to
increase order to 200/each.

Moore Medical LLC

| |First Offer - $0.0523

150 / each | $7.845 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 30870
Vendor Notes:
Terumo #3NN-2325R Sold by the box of 100 only

QUADMED INC

|| First Offer - $0.075

150 / each | $11.25 | |y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: TERUMO
Vendor Notes:
23G
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City of Fort Lauderdale
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Bound Tree Medical | |First Offer - $0.0839 | 150 / each $12.585 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: G0827
Vendor Notes:
THIS ITEM IS ONLY SOLD PER BOX
100/BOX
$8.39/BOX
Gate Medicals, lic || First Offer - $0.15 | 150 /each | $22.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
patriot medical supplies | | First Offer - $0.27 | 150 / each | $40.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: JG23-X.X
Vendor Notes:
Available in lengths of 0.5, 1.0 and 1.5"
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $9.86 | 150 / each $1,479.00 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 305145
Vendor Notes:
BD
562-9341-1-04 Glugagon
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | First Offer - $0.00 | 200 / each $0.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
No Bid
Moore Medical LLC || First Offer - $80.82 | 200 /each | $16,164.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 75244
Vendor Notes:
Bound Tree Medical || First Offer - $89.70 | 200 /each | $17,940.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 00000214500
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical || First Offer - $94.00 | 200 /each | $18,800.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 7662
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $98.28 | 200 / each $19,656.00 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
Gate Medicals, lic | [First Offer - $184.30 | 200 /each | $36,860.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0002-8031-01
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-05 Flex-guide ET tube introducer
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | First Offer - $0.00 | 300 / each $0.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
No Bid
Gate Medicals, lic || First Offer - $2.59 | 300 / each | $777.00 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
Moore Medical LLC || First Offer - $7.53 | 300 / each | $2,259.00 | Y

Agency Notes:
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City of Fort Lauderdale

Vendor Notes:

Bid 562-9341

Henry Schein Inc | | First offer - $7.59 | 300 / each | $2,277.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 4990773
Vendor Notes:
Bound Tree Medical | | First offer - $7.93 | 300 / each | $2,379.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: D4398
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $14.02 | 300 / each $4,206.00 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
ALLOW 4 WEEKS FOR ORDER TO BE RECIEVED
562-9341-1-06 14G Angiocath
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Henry Schein Inc | First Offer - $4.25 | 30/ each $127.50 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8016609
Vendor Notes:
Sold 10/box $42.53
Bound Tree Medical | | First Offer - $4.51 | 30/ each | $135.30 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 352832
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | | First Offer - $5.39 | 30/ each | $161.70 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 132-38-2268ea
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $6.75 | 30/ each $202.50 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | | First offer - $6.75 | 30/ each | $202.50 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: BD IV CATH
Vendor Notes:
Gate Medicals, lic | |First Offer - $38.50 | 30/ each | $1,155.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: BD
Vendor Notes:
BD angiocath IV needles
562-9341-1-07 N95 particulate respirator
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. |First Offer - $0.00 | 150 / each $0.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
No Bid
Bound Tree Medical | [First Offer - $1.32 | 150/ each | $198.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 9211
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | [First Offer - $2.00 | 150 / each | $300.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 3M 9211, N95
Vendor Notes:
Gate Medicals, lic | [First Offer - $3.66 | 150 / each | $549.00 | | v

Agency Notes:

Dec 23, 2005 7:51:53 AM EST

RFP Depot, LLC

Supplier Product Code: 1860

p. 4



City of Fort Lauderdale

Vendor Notes:
Regular Particulate Respirator Mask Cone. 3M product.

562-9341-1-08 Oxygen Flowmeter, 15 Ipm

Vendor

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

First Offer - $18.33

15 / each $274.95 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 715-1MFA1001
Vendor Notes:

Bound Tree Medical | [First Offer - $21.57 | 15/ each | $323.55 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 381001
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | |[First Offer - $29.00 | 15/ each | $435.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: PRECISION MEDICAL
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $40.11 | 15/ each $601.65 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
ALLOW 4 WEEKS FOR DELIVERY
Gate Medicals, lic | [First Offer - $90.00 | 15/ each | $1,350.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
These precision Medical Flowmeters are available in
both a rugged chrome plated brass and an aluminum
body model. Features a 0-15 LPM flow rate, Lexan
flowtube and positive shut-off control valve that will
not drift from a set flow rate over extended durations
562-9341-1-09 3.5 ET tubes
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical |First Offer - $1.10 | 75/ each $82.50 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 028235
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $1.15 | 75/ each | $86.25 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-100382035EA
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $1.18 | 75/ each | $88.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0430
Vendor Notes:
Moore Medical LLC | [First Offer - $1.19 | 75/ each | $89.25 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 47685
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | [First Offer - $1.50 | 75 / each | $112.50 | [ v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RUSCH UNCUFFED
Vendor Notes:
Henry Schein Inc | |First Offer - $1.59 | 75/ each | $119.25 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8265976
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $3.42
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MEDICAL SUPPLI

City of Fort Lauderdale

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Vendor Notes:

COMES IN A CASE OF TEN ONLY AND SOLD BY THE
CASE ONLY

patriot medical supplies | |First Offer - $3.96 | 75/ each | $297.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Vendor Notes:
Gate Medicals, lic | |[First Offer - $5.35 | 75 / each | $401.25 | | v

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 5-10107
Vendor Notes:

562-9341-1-10 4.5 ET tubes

Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical |First Offer - $1.10 | 75/ each $82.50 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 028245
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $1.15 | 75/ each | $86.25 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-100382045EA
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $1.18 | 75/ each | $88.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0432
Vendor Notes:
Moore Medical LLC | |[First Offer - $1.19 | 75 / each | $89.25 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 47689
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | |[First Offer - $1.50 | 75 / each | $112.50 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RUSCH UNCUFFED
Vendor Notes:
Henry Schein Inc | |First Offer - $1.59 | 75/ each | $119.25 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8263672
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $3.42 | 75/ each $256.50 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
COMES IN A CASE OF TEN ONLY AND SOLD BY THE
CASE ONLY
patriot medical supplies | |First Offer - $3.96 | 75/ each | $297.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
Gate Medicals, lic | [First Offer - $5.34 | 75 / each | $400.50 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-11 5.5 ET tubes
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical First Offer - $1.10 | 75/ each $82.50 Y

Agency Notes:
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City of Fort Lauderdale

Bid 562-9341

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $1.15 | 75/ each | $86.25 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-100382055EA
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $1.18 | 75/ each | $88.50 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0434
Vendor Notes:
Moore Medical LLC | |[First Offer - $1.19 | 75/ each | $89.25 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 67962
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | |[First Offer - $1.50 | 75/ each | $112.50 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RUSCH UNCUFFED
Vendor Notes:
Henry Schein Inc | |First Offer - $1.59 75 / each | $119.25 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8266500
Vendor Notes:
Sold 10/bx at 15.90
patriot medical supplies | |First Offer - $2.12 | 75/ each | $159.00 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $3.42 | 75/ each $256.50 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
COMES IN A CASE OF TEN ONLY AND SOLD BY THE
CASE ONLY
Gate Medicals, lic | |[First Offer - $5.34 | 75 / each $400.50 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-12 6.5 ET tubes
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical | First Offer - $1.16 | 75/ each $87.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 028265
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | | First Offer - $1.18 | 75/ each | $88.50 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0276
Vendor Notes:
Moore Medical LLC | | First offer - $1.19 | 75/ each | $89.25 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 67964
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | | First Offer - $1.23 | 75/ each | $92.25 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-112082065EA
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | | First Offer - $1.50 | 75 / each | $112.50 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RUSCH CUFFED
Vendor Notes:
Henry Schein Inc | | First Offer - $1.59 | 75/ each | $119.25 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8269260
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City of Fort Lauderdale

Vendor Notes:

Bid 562-9341

patriot medical supplies | | First Offer - $2.12 | 75/ each | $159.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:

Vendor Notes:
Gate Medicals, lic | |[First Offer - $6.209 | 75 / each | $465.675 | | Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:

562-9341-1-13 70mm OPA

Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical |First Offer - $0.13 | 75/ each $9.75 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: D4244
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $0.16 | 75/ each | $12.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 10214
Vendor Notes:
Henry Schein Inc | |First Offer - $0.23 | 75/ each | $17.25 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 8262316
Vendor Notes:
Sold 50/bx at 11.44
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $0.24 | 75/ each | $18.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-121870EA
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | |[First offer - $1.00 | 75/ each | $75.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: BERMAN ORAL AIRWAYS
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-14 10 FR NG Tubes
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical |First Offer - $0.71 | 30/ each $21.30 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 320111
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | [First Offer - $1.00 | 30 / each | $30.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RUSCH NASO GAST
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $1.05 | 30/ each | $31.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 4131
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $1.06 | 30 / each | $31.80 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-235200100EA
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-15 18 FR NG Tubes
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical First Offer - $0.71 | 30/ each $21.30 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 320118

Vendor Notes:
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City of Fort Lauderdale

Bid 562-9341

QUADMED INC | |First Offer - $1.00 | 30/ each | $30.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: RUSCH NASO GAST
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $1.05 | 30/ each | $31.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 4755
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $1.06 | 30 / each | $31.80 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 76-235200180EA
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-16 Dopamine Drip
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical | First Offer - $5.79 | 150 / each $868.50 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 0074780902
Vendor Notes:
Alliance Medical | |First Offer - $10.50 | 150 / each | $1,575.00 | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 6506
Vendor Notes:
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $19.36 150 / each | $2,904.00 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 043-07809-22
Vendor Notes:
Sold 24 per case $232.32
HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS First Offer - $20.50 | 150 / each $3,075.00 Y
MEDICAL SUPPLI
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-17 Kwik Cric MVP, 6.0mm
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | First Offer - $0.00 | 50 / each $0.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code:
Vendor Notes:
No Bid
Bound Tree Medical || First Offer - $15.85 | 50/ each | $792.50 | | Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: 351631
Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC | |First Offer - $135.00 | 50 / each | $6,750.00 | | v
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: QUICK TRACH
Vendor Notes:
562-9341-1-18 Laryngeal tube size 3.0
Vendor Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch.| Docs
Bound Tree Medical | First Offer - $0.00 | 50 / each $0.00 Y
Agency Notes: Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Vendor Notes:
NO BID
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. | |First Offer - $45.00 50 / each | $2,250.00 | | Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 477-KLTD213EA
Vendor Notes:
Bid King LTD Kit
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City of Fort Lauderdale

562-9341-1-19 Laryngeal tube size 4.0

Vendor

Unit Price | Qty/Unit

Total Price | Attch.| Docs

Bound Tree Medical

| First Offer - $0.00 | 50 / each $0.00 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Vendor Notes:
NO BID

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

| |[First Offer - $45.00 | 50/ each |

$2,250.00 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 477-KLTD214EA
Vendor Notes:
Bid King LTD Kit

562-9341-1-20 Laryngeal tube size 5.0

Vendor

Unit Price | Qty/Unit

Total Price | Attch.| Docs

Bound Tree Medical

| First Offer - $0.00 | 50 / each $0.00 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: NO BID
Vendor Notes:
NO BID

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

| |First Offer - $45.00 | 50 / each |

$2,250.00 Y

Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 477-KLTD215EA
Vendor Notes:
Bid King LTD Kit

Vendor Totals

Dec 23, 2005 7:51:53 AM EST

Tri-anim Health Services, Inc. $10,895.45
Bid Contact Debbie Dettman Address 13170 Telfair Avenue
D.Dettman@Tri-anim.com Sylmar, CA 91342
Ph 818-362-6882 x5308
Fax 818-362-8681
Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
Bound Tree Medical $23,510.775
Bid Contact Cathy Taynor Address 5200 Rings Road Suite A
ctaynor@boundtree.com Dublin, OH 43017
Ph 614-760-5036
Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
Moore Medical LLC $19,146.165
Bid Contact Michele LeDuc Address 389 John Downey Dr
mleduc@mooremedical.com Bid Quote Department
Ph 800-234-1464 x5425 New Britain, CT 06050
Fax 877-354-5916
Vendor Code 00013891
Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
QUADMED INC $9,633.75
Bid Contact marley price Address 11210 - 10 philips ind. blvd. E

sales@gquadmed.com
Ph 904-880-2323 x11

Vendor Code 00013892
Qualifications WBE
Agency Notes:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32256

Vendor Notes:

Gate Medicals, lic
Bid Contact

gary plancher
plancher@gatemedicals.com

Ph 318-797-5743 x117
Vendor Code 00020642
Qualifications DBE MBE
Agency Notes:

$43,175.925

Address 1780 E. Bert Kouns Ste 809
shreveport, LA 71105

Vendor Notes:

RFP Depot, LLC
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City of Fort Lauderdale Bid 562-9341

Alliance Medical $21,201.00
Bid Contact Michelle Collins Address PO Box 147
collinsm@allmed.net Russellville, MO 65074

Ph 573-782-4411 x122
Vendor Code 00021929

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

HERBMOR PHARMACEUTICALS MEDICAL SUPPLI $32,774.65

Bid Contact OYET O OYETUNJI Address 9111 PEMBROKE ROAD
herbmor@netrox.com PEMBROKE PINES, FL 33025

Ph 954-447-1823
Vendor Code 00023151
Qualifications DBE MBE

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

patriot medical supplies $1,748.00

Bid Contact Hrich Lacsamana Address 4906 harvest hill road
hrichl@patriotmedicalsupplies.com dallas, TX 75244

Ph 214-207-0752
Qualifications DBE MBE

Bid Notes Patriot Medical Supplies is Minority owned and operated. It is SDB and Hubzone certified
with the Small Business Administration.

Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
Boca Medical Supply $661.535
Bid Contact Carl English Address 648 Glades Rd.
bmsilcenglish@bellsouth.net Boca Raton, FL 33431
Ph 561-368-7430
Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:
Henry Schein Inc $3,290.75
Bid Contact Luke Marchese Address 135 Duryea Rd M495
luke.marchese@henryschein.com Melville, NY 11747
Ph 800-972-2611 x8159
Agency Notes: Vendor Notes:

**All bids/proposals submitted for the designated project are reflected on this tabulation sheet. However, the listing of the
bid/proposal on this tabulation sheet shall not be construed as a comment on the responsiveness of such bid/proposal or as any
indication that the agency accepts such bid/proposal as being responsive. The agency will make a determination as to the
responsiveness of the vendor responses submitted based upon compliance with all applicable laws, purchasing guidelines and
project documents, including but not limited to the project specifications and contract documents. The agency will notify the
successful vendor upon award of the contract and, as according to the law, all bid/proposal responses received will be available
for inspection at that time.
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