
# Item Description Qty. U/M
Unit 
Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension Unit Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension

           
1 Item #1 2 14551.40 $29,102.80 17117.00 $34,234.00 16817.00 $33,634.00 16444.00 $32,888.00 21328.38 42,656.76 13934.53 $27,869.06 13934.53 $27,869.06

25 KW Generator
2 Item #2 2 20714.98 $41,429.96 26819.00 $53,638.00 24017.00 $48,034.00 23577.00 $47,154.00 24640.99 49,281.98 29899.41 $59,798.82 29899.41 $59,798.82

50 KW generator
3 Item #3 11 34878.18 $383,659.98 32934.00 $362,274.00 35886.00 $394,746.00 34872.00 $383,592.00 42396.67 466,363.37 43589.24 $479,481.64 58121.00 $639,331.00

100 KW Generator
4 Item #4 2 40593.09 $81,186.18 68722.00 $137,444.00 71601.00 $143,202.00 70156.00 $140,312.00 76833.33 153,666.66 83432.00 $166,864.00 83432.00 $166,864.00

250 KW Generator
5 Item #5 9 NO BID INCLUDED 1722.00 $15,498.00 1722.00 $15,498.00 1861.11 16,749.99 NO BID NO BID

35' Power Cable
6 Item #6 2 NO BID INCLUDED 2123.00 $4,246.00 2123.00 $4,246.00 2222.22 4,444.44 NO BID NO BID

50' Power Cable
                  $535,378.92 $587,590.00 $619,616.00 $603,946.00 $711,968.77 $734,013.52 $893,862.88

NO BID INCLUDED $19,744.00 $19,744.00 $21,194.43 NO BID NO BID
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$535,378.92 $587,590.00 $639,360.00 $623,690.00 $733,163.20 $734,013.52 $893,862.88

N/R

Variances or Comments See Bid

Delivery Time

Warranty Information See Bid 2 Years

See Bid

60-75 Days (25,50,100 KW) 
160-180 Days (250 KW)

60-75 Days (25,50,100 KW) 160-
180 Days (250 KW)

Sub Total - Cables Only (Items 5-6)

N/R = Non-responsive
** Low Responsive & Responsible Bidder

Grand Total - Generators & Cables (Items 1-6)

See BidSee Bid

Less discount for total items bid or Visa

See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid

21 Days (25,50 KW) 60 Days 
(100 KW) 45 Days (250 KW)

See Bid

See Bid See Bid

See Bid See Bid

See Bid

VENDOR

MBE/WBE?
City, State

Sun Power Diesel & 
Marine** Godwin Pumps GCIron       (Alternate)Kelly Tractor Godwin 

Pumps(Alternate) United Rentals GCIron

Deerfield Bch, FL Hollywood, FL

06/15/06

662-9518
Portable Trailer Mounted Generators

ITB #

Open Date
Description

CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION

Hollywood, FLBridgeport, NJ

Payment Terms See Bid N-30 See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid See Bid

Sub Total - Generators Only (Items 1-4)

Miami, FL Dania Beach FL Bridgeport, NJ

Item 4, 160 KW

See Bid



# Item Description Qty. U/M
Unit 
Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension Unit Price Extension

Unit 
Price Extension

           
1 Item #1 2 21100.00 $42,200.00 22185.00 $44,370.00 22505.00 $45,010.00 24750.00 $49,500.00 44605.00 89,210.00

25 KW Generator
2 Item #2 2 27100.00 $54,200.00 25622.00 $51,244.00 29147.00 $58,294.00 32100.00 $64,200.00 49796.00 99,592.00

50 KW generator
3 Item #3 11 38750.00 $426,250.00 44111.00 $485,221.00 45796.00 $503,756.00 49200.00 $541,200.00 53801.00 591,811.00

100 KW Generator
4 Item #4 2 98350.00 $196,700.00 79315.00 $158,630.00 76782.00 $153,564.00 121000.00 $242,000.00 98861.00 197,722.00

250 KW Generator
5 Item #5 9 1550.00 $13,950.00 NO BID NO BID 1590.00 $14,310.00 1818.00 16,362.00

35' Power Cable
6 Item #6 2 1895.00 $3,790.00 NO BID NO BID 2300.00 $4,600.00 2272.00 4,544.00

50' Power Cable
                  $719,350.00 $739,465.00 $760,624.00 $896,900.00 $978,335.00

$17,740.00 NO BID NO BID $18,910.00 $20,906.00
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$737,090.00 $739,465.00 $760,624.00 $915,810.00 $999,241.00

470/12
36/2
17/0

8
0

Madison, WI

AC Industrial Servce

Hialeah, FLCity, State Miami, FL Ft. Lauderdale, FL Hollywood, FL
MBEMBE/WBE? MBE

VENDOR

ITB #
Portable Trailer Mounted GeneratorsDescription
662-9518

Solar Technology 
SystemsNationsRentFlorida Detroit 

Diesel/Allison

06/15/06Open Date

Customized Support 
Services

Variances or Comments See Bid See Bid See Bid
Delivery Time See Bid See Bid See Bid

Warranty Information See Bid See Bid See Bid See BidSee Bid

Grand Total - Generators & Cables (Items 1-6)

Sub Total - Generators Only (Items 1-4)
Sub Total - Cables Only (Items 5-6)
Less discount for total items bid or Visa

Late Bids:

Payment Terms See Bid See Bid

Number of bids solicited/received:
MBE (Solicited/Received):
WBE (Solicited/Received):
No Bids:

** Apparent Low Bidder

See Bid See Bid
See Bid See Bid

See Bid See Bid See Bid

CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION


